THE NINTH SCHEDULE
[See section 69(1)]

Sl Notification number Amendment Period of effect
No. and date
(1) (2 (3 (4)

1. G.S.R. 679(E), dated the 25th
August, 2003 [69/2003-Central
Excise, dated 25th August, 2003]

2. G.S.R. 60(E), dated the 21st January,
2004 [8/2004-Central Excise, dated
21st January, 2004]

3. G.S.R. 60(E), dated the 21st January,
2004 as amended by G.S.R. 419(E),
dated the 9th July, 2004 [28/2004-
Central Excise, dated 9th July, 2004]

In the notification referred to in column (2), in
conditions (C) and (D), for the words “six months”,
at both places where they occur, the words “two
years” shall be substituted.

In the notification referred to in column (2), in
conditions (C) and (D), for the words “six months”,
at both places where they occur, the words “two
years” shall be substituted.

In the notification referred to in column (2), in
conditions (C) and (D) relating to period of
investment from escrow account, for the words
“two years”, at both places where they occur, the
words “four years” shall be substituted.

25th August, 2003 to 31st
March, 2006 (both days
inclusive), in so far as it relates
to period of investment
referred to in conditions (C)
and (D) referred to in column

A).

21st January, 2004 to 30th
September, 2006 (both days
inclusive), in so far as it relates
to period of investment
referred to in conditions (C)
and (D) referred to in column

@).

9th July, 2004 to 31st May,
2011 (both days inclusive), in
so far as it relates to period of
investment made from
escrow account referred to in
conditions (C) and (D)
referred to in column (3).

http://indiabudget.nic.in

76

10

15

20

25



